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This proposed project would 
relocated SR13 to the southwest 
along the Kokosing River and 
connect South Main Street to 
Sandusky Street. This new 3-lane 
road would replace Phillips Dr and 
carry 2-way traffic. This project will 
increase the buffer between the 
road and the River. This project 
additionally proposes to reroute 
SR 229 and US 36 through Public 
Square and improve pedestrian 
mobility. 

Project Name: KNO-13-10.99

Common Name: State Route 13 
Relocation 

Sponsor: City of Mount Vernon

ODOT Project ID: 116840

CORPO CTP Project: Yes

Competitive Advantage Project: 
Yes

Total Project Cost: $15.2 million

Current TRAC Status: Tier II - 
Development

Requested TRAC Status: Tier 1 - 
Construction 

County: Knox

ODOT District: District 5

Jurisdictions: Mount Vernon

Routes: SR 13

Complete
12/18/2018

N/A

Complete
10/30/2023

Not Started
6/26/2026

In Progress
6/1/2024 (est.)

Not Started
1/20/2026

Not Started
1/27/2026 (est.)

The City of Mount Vernon is 
requesting to move to Tier I status 
and requests $5.6 million for 
Construction in fiscal year 2025.

State Route 13 Relocation
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This project will complete the 
development-driven improvements 
and master plan envisioned for the 
Rickenbacker East-West Connector 
by converting the existing 
intersection into a full interchange. 

Project Name: PIC-US23/SR762-
21.08/11.17

Common Name: US 23 & SR 762 
Interchange

Sponsor: ODOT District 6

ODOT Project ID: 115425

CORPO CTP Project: Yes

Competitive Advantage Project: 
No

Total Project Cost: $83 million

Current TRAC Status: Tier II - 
Development

Requested TRAC Status: Tier II - 
Development

County: Pickaway

ODOT District: District 6

Jurisdictions: Unincorporated 
Harrison Township

Routes: US 23, SR 762

Complete
5/1/2020

In Progress
8/1/2025 (est.)

In Progress 
8/1/2025 (est.)

Not Started
8/1/2026 (est.)

In Progress 
6/1/2026 (est.)

Not Started
8/1/2026 (est.)

Not Started
5/1/2027 (est.)

ODOT District 6 is requesting 
to remain at Tier II status and is 
requesting $5 million for right-of-
way in fiscal year 2025. 

US 23 & SR 762 Interchange
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